
ELKHORN PUBLIC SCHOOLS 
MINUTES OF BOARD OF EDUCATION 

REGULAR MEETING 
June 10, 2019 

 
The regular meeting of the Elkhorn Public Schools Board of Education was called to order at 6:30 PM.  Members 
present:  J. Marasco, A. Clark, A. Parks, R. Vokt, and N. Rogic-Greufe.  C. Burney absent and excused.  President 
John Marasco noted that the meeting was governed by the Open Meetings Act, a copy of which is posted on the 
east wall of the Board Room. 
 
For the “Good News Report” J. Marasco congratulated Mia Giandinoto, Megan Raszler, Ted Gernhart, and Michael 
Kelly for being recognized by Governor Ricketts during a ceremony at the State Capitol for their academic 
achievement of earning a perfect 36 on the ACT.   Also, congratulations to the students at Spring Ridge elementary 
for being named the Omaha metro area’s Pints to Gallons Milk Drive top fundraiser! Students raised more than 
$4,000 for community food pantries to purchase an under-donated item: milk. The school was rewarded with a 
visit from Kansas City Chiefs mascot KC Wolf on May 13th.  
 
It was moved by A. Clark, seconded by A. Parks to approve the Consent Agenda items including:  approval of 
agenda, approval of minutes for Monday, May 13, 2019 and approval of June bills for payment.   
 
VOTE:  J. Marasco - yes; A. Parks - yes; R. Vokt - yes; N. Rogic-Greufe - yes; A. Clark - yes 
 
It was moved by R. Vokt, seconded by N. Rogic-Greufe to approve the request for release of contract for the 2019-
20 school year for Makalla Fritz and Marlene Chandler as recommended by the administration.   
 
VOTE:  A. Clark – yes; J. Marasco - yes; A. Parks - yes; R. Vokt - yes; N. Rogic-Greufe - yes 
 
It was moved by N. Rogic-Greufe, seconded by A. Clark to approve the appointment of Riley Devney, Rebecca 
Baker, Bradley Henderson, Sara Moseman, and Rachel Johnson in 2019-20.   
 
VOTE:  J. Marasco - yes; A. Parks - yes; R. Vokt - yes; N. Rogic-Greufe - yes; A. Clark – yes 
 
It was moved by R. Vokt, seconded by A. Parks to approve the attendance boundaries impacting Elkhorn High 
School, Elkhorn North High School, Elkhorn Middle School, Grandview Middle School, MS#5, Manchester 
Elementary, West Dodge Station Elementary, Sagewood Elementary, Hillrise Elementary, Westridge Elementary, 
Elementary #12, and Spring Ridge Elementary as presented publically by the administration on April 8, 2019 and 
April 24, 2019. 
 
VOTE:  A. Parks - yes; R. Vokt - yes; N. Rogic-Greufe - yes; A. Clark – yes; J. Marasco - yes 
 
It was moved by A. Clark, seconded by N. Rogic-Greufe to approve the early graduation requests as identified and 
recommended by their principal. 
 
VOTE:  R. Vokt - yes; N. Rogic-Greufe - yes; A. Clark – yes; J. Marasco – yes; A. Parks – yes 
 
It was moved by N. Rogic-Greufe, seconded by A. Clark to approve a $.10 increase to the price of an elementary 
lunch and a $.05 increase to the price of a middle and high school lunch for the 2019-20 school year as recommended 
by Sodexo and the Nebraska Department of Education while all other meal prices remain the same as the previous 
year. 
 
VOTE:  N. Rogic-Greufe - yes; A. Clark – yes; J. Marasco – yes; A. Parks – yes; R. Vokt – yes 
 
It was moved by A. Parks, seconded by R. Vokt to approve parent pay bus rates of $48.50 one-way and $85.00 
round-trip for the 2019-20 school year.   
 
VOTE:  A. Clark – yes; J. Marasco – yes; A. Parks – yes; R. Vokt – yes; N. Rogic-Greufe – yes 
 
 
 



It was moved by A. Clark, seconded by R. Vokt to approve the proposed Superintendent Contract with 
Superintendent Bary Habrock effective July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2022 as recommended by the Negotiations 
Committee.  
 
VOTE:  A. Clark – yes; J. Marasco – yes; A. Parks – yes; R. Vokt – yes; N. Rogic-Greufe – yes 
 
It was moved N. Rogic-Greufe, seconded A. Clark to name elementary #12, which is under construction near 180th 
between Fort Street and Ida Streets, Woodbrook Elementary School. 
 
VOTE:  J. Marasco – yes; A. Parks – yes; R. Vokt – yes; N. Rogic-Greufe – yes; A. Clark – yes 
 
It was moved by A. Clark, seconded by A. Parks to enter into a Closed Session of the Elkhorn Board of Education for 
the purposes of discussing collective bargaining, litigation strategies, and real estate purchases. 
 
VOTE:  R. Vokt – yes; N. Rogic-Greufe – yes; A. Clark – yes; J. Marasco – yes; A. Parks – yes 
 
The Elkhorn Board of Education went into Closed Session at 7:14 PM. No action was taken during this Closed 
Session and the board reconvened in Open Session prior to adjournment by President J. Marasco at 7:40 PM.  The 
next regular meeting of the Board is scheduled for Monday, July 15, 2019 at 6:30 PM, in the Board Room of the 
Administration Building, 20650 Glenn Street, Elkhorn, NE 68022.   
  
 
 
 


